
COUNCIL ROCK SCHOOL DISTRICT

Snow Removal De-icing Services Bid 22-20

Bid Tabulation 23MAY19

VENDOR
School 

Year

 Quad (4 

wheeler 

with 

blade) 

 Hand 

Labor (if 

ordered for 

hand 

shoveling) 

4B CONSTRUCTION 

CORPORATION

2022-

2023
 $ 160.00 8FT  $      170 9 FT  no bid   $       230 

11 

FT
 $   180  1 CY  $   225  $   225 

10 

FT
 no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid  

2023-

2024
 $ 170.00  $      180  no bid   $       240  $   190  $   235  $   235  no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid  

2024-

2025
 $ 180.00  $      190  no bid   $       250  $   200  $   245  $   245  no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid  

VENDOR
School 

Year

 Quad (4 

wheeler 

with 

blade) 

 Hand 

Labor (if 

ordered for 

hand 

shoveling) 

4B CONSTRUCTION 

CORPORATION

2022-

2023
 $ 160.00 8FT  $      170 9 FT  No bid   $       230 

11 

FT
 $   180  1 CY  $   225  $   225 

10 

FT
 No bid  No bid  No bid  no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid  

2023-

2024
 $ 170.00  $      180  No bid   $       240  $   190  $   235  $   235  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid  

2024-

2025
 $ 180.00  $      190  No bid   $       250  $   200  $   245  $   245  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid   no bid   no bid   no bid  

EFFLUENT RETRIEVAL 

SERVICES, INC.

2022-

2023
 $ 160.00 8 FT  $      160 8 FT  $       170 

10 

FT
 $       170 

10 

FT
 $   170 

 1.5 

CY 
 $   195  $   225 

9 

FT
 $     280 2 CY  $     280 9 FT  $   170 8 FT  no bid   $     125  $           55  $   3,200 

2023-

2024
 $ 165.00  $      165  $       175  $       175  $   175  $   200  $   235  $     290  $     290  $   175  no bid   $     130  $           60  $   3,400 

2024-

2025
 $ 170.00  $      170  $       180  $       180  $   180  $   210  $   245  $     305  $     305  $   180  no bid   $     135  $           65  $   3,600 

VENDOR
School 

Year

 Quad (4 

wheeler 

with 

blade) 

 Hand 

Labor (if 

ordered for 

hand 

shoveling) 

4B CONSTRUCTION 

CORPORATION

2022-

2023
 $ 160.00 8FT  $      170 9 FT  no bid   $       230 

11 

FT
 $   180  1 CY  $   225  $   225 

10 

FT
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

2024-

2025
 $ 180.00  $      190  no bid   $       250  $   200  $   245  $   245  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

EFFLUENT RETRIEVAL 

SERVICES, INC.

2022-

2023
 $ 160.00 8 FT  $      160 8 FT  $       170 

10 

FT
 $       170 

10 

FT
 $   170 

 1.5 

CY 
 $   195 2 HP  $   225 

9 

FT
 $     280 2 CY  $      280 9 FT  $   170 8 FT  No Bid  $     125  $           55  $   3,200 

2023-

2024
 $ 165.00  $      165  $       175  $       175  $   175  $   200  $   235  $     290  $      290  $   175  No Bid  $     130  $           60  $   3,400 

2024-

2025
 $ 170.00  $      170  $       180  $       180  $   180  $   210  $   245  $     305  $      305  $   180  No Bid  $     135  $           65  $   3,600 

VENDOR
School 

Year

 Quad (4 

wheeler 

with 

blade) 

 Hand 

Labor (if 

ordered for 

hand 

shoveling) 

4B CONSTRUCTION 

CORPORATION

2022-

2023
 $ 160.00 8 FT  $      170 9 FT  no bid   $       230 

11

FT.
 $   180  1CY  $   225  $   225 

10 

FT
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

2023-

2024
 $ 170.00  $      180  no bid   $       240  $   190  $   235  $   235  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

2024-

2025
 $ 180.00  $      190  no bid   $       250  $   200  $   245  $   245  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

VENDOR
School 

Year

 Quad (4 

wheeler 

with 

blade) 

 Hand 

Labor (if 

ordered for 

hand 

shoveling) 

4B CONSTRUCTION 

CORPORATION

2022-

2023
 $ 160.00 8FT  $      170 9 FT  no bid   $       230 

11

FT.
 $   180  1 CY  $   225  $   225 

10 

FT
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

2023-

2024
 $ 170.00  $      180  no bid   $       240  $   190  $   235  $   235  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

2024-

2025
 $ 180.00  $      190  no bid   $       250  $   200  $   245  $   245  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

VENDOR
School 

Year

 Quad (4 

wheeler 

with 

blade) 

 Hand 

Labor (if 

ordered for 

hand 

shoveling) 

4B CONSTRUCTION 

CORPORATION

2022-

2023
 $ 160.00 8FT  $      170 9 FT  no bid  $       230 

11 

FT
 $   180  1 CY  $   225  $   225 

10 

FT
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

2024-

2025
 $ 170.00  $      180  no bid  $       240  $   190  $   235  $   235  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

2023-

2024
 $ 180.00  $      190  no bid  $       250  $   200  $   245  $   245  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

4WD Tractor 

with blade
Other / Specify

Salting/De-Icing  

Operations/ occurrence 

(includes labor, equip. & 

materials)

LOCATION: CRHS-NORTH, GREEN LANE & NEWTOWN MIDDLE SCHOOL

4WD pickup 

Truck with 

blade (F250, 

C20, 10,000# 

GVWR or 

smaller)

1 ton truck with 

blade (F350, 

C30, 10,000# 

GVWR or 

larger)

Large Dump 

Truck with 

blade (17,500# 

GVWR or 

larger)

Large Dump 

Truck with 

blade (26,000# 

GVWR or 

larger)

 Skid 

Steer/Bobcat 

Backhoe with 

Loader

Backhoe 

with Box
Rubber tire loader

Rubber tire 

loader with box

Backhoe 

with Box
Rubber tire loader

Rubber tire 

loader with box

4WD Tractor 

with blade
Other / Specify

Salting/De-Icing  

Operations/ occurrence 

(includes labor, equip. & 

materials)

LOCATION: CRHS-SOUTH & ROLLING HILLS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

4WD pickup 

Truck with 

blade (F250, 

C20, 10,000# 

GVWR or 

smaller)

1 ton truck with 

blade (F350, 

C30, 10,000# 

GVWR or 

larger)

Large Dump 

Truck with 

blade (17,500# 

GVWR or 

larger)

Large Dump 

Truck with 

blade (26,000# 

GVWR or 

larger)

 Skid 

Steer/Bobcat 

Backhoe with 

Loader

LOCATION: HOLLAND MIDDLE SCHOOL & HILLCREST ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

4WD pickup 

Truck with 

blade (F250, 

C20, 10,000# 

GVWR or 

smaller)

1 ton truck with 

blade (F350, 

C30, 10,000# 

GVWR or 

larger)

Large Dump 

Truck with 

blade (17,500# 

GVWR or 

larger)

Large Dump 

Truck with 

blade (26,000# 

GVWR or 

larger)

 Skid 

Steer/Bobcat 

Backhoe with 

Loader

Backhoe 

with Box
Rubber tire loader

Rubber tire 

loader with box

4WD Tractor 

with blade
Other / Specify

Salting/De-Icing  

Operations/ occurrence 

(includes labor, equip. & 

materials)

 No Bid  no bid   $       240  $   190 
2023-

2024
 $ 170.00  $      180  $   235  $   235  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

LOCATION: Other Sites

Rubber tire loader
Rubber tire 

loader with box

4WD Tractor 

with blade
Other / Specify

Salting/De-Icing  

Operations/ occurrence 

(includes labor, equip. & 

materials)

LOCATION: Welch Elementary School

4WD pickup 

Truck with 

blade (F250, 

C20, 10,000# 

GVWR or 

smaller)

1 ton truck with 

blade (F350, 

C30, 10,000# 

GVWR or 

larger)

Large Dump 

Truck with 

blade (17,500# 

GVWR or 

larger)

Large Dump 

Truck with 

blade (26,000# 

GVWR or 

larger)

 Skid 

Steer/Bobcat 

Backhoe with 

Loader

Backhoe 

with Box

Backhoe 

with Box
Rubber tire loader

Rubber tire 

loader with box

4WD Tractor 

with blade
Other / Specify

Salting/De-Icing  

Operations/ occurrence 

(includes labor, equip. & 

materials)

4WD pickup 

Truck with 

blade (F250, 

C20, 10,000# 

GVWR or 

smaller)

1 ton truck with 

blade (F350, 

C30, 10,000# 

GVWR or 

larger)

Large Dump 

Truck with 

blade (17,500# 

GVWR or 

larger)

Large Dump 

Truck with 

blade (26,000# 

GVWR or 

larger)

 Skid 

Steer/Bobcat 

Backhoe with 

Loader

Backhoe 

with Box

Backhoe with 

Loader

 Skid 

Steer/Bobcat 

Large Dump 

Truck with 

blade (26,000# 

GVWR or 

larger)

Large Dump 

Truck with 

blade (17,500# 

GVWR or 

larger)

1 ton truck with 

blade (F350, 

C30, 10,000# 

GVWR or 

larger)

4WD pickup 

Truck with 

blade (F250, 

C20, 10,000# 

GVWR or 

smaller)

LOCATION: Goodnoe Elementary School

Rubber tire loader
Rubber tire 

loader with box

4WD Tractor 

with blade
Other / Specify

Salting/De-Icing  

Operations/ occurrence 

(includes labor, equip. & 

materials)


